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CrosswordFor Better or Worse • Lynn Johnston

Beetle Bailey • Mort Walker

Zits • Jim Borgman & Jerry Scott

Hagar the Horrible • Chris Browne

Sally Forth • Greg Howard

Garfield • Jim Davis

Blondie • Chic Young

Cryptoquip

Family Circus • Bill Keane

Keep Your Eye on the Ball
There are times when declarer must make an

unnatural play in order to bring in the contract.
South passed his test with flying colors in
today’s deal.

First, a word about the bidding. South had a
problem of sorts in selecting his opening bid.
He gave thought to opening with five dia-
monds, but dismissed that option on the ground
that his hand was too strong for a pre-emptive
bid. Ultimately, he decided to open one dia-
mond in order to increase the possibility of
reaching a slam if his partner happened to hold
a good hand.

As things turned out, South had his work cut
out for him just to make five diamonds. West
led a spade. Declarer played low from dummy,
and when East won the trick with the king,
South dropped his queen on it!

As a result of this unusual play, South made
the contract. He was later able to finesse the ten
of spades and discard a heart on the ace of
spades to bring his total to 11 tricks.

Of course, had South played the four of
spades on the king, he would have wound up
with only one spade trick and would have fin-
ished down one, losing a spade, a heart and a
club.

It is certainly unusual for a declarer to play a
queen instead of a four on a trick he has already
lost, but it is the kind of play any declarer who
does not proceed automatically might make.

How to Capture a Sovereign
There are plays a declarer must resist despite

their magnetic attraction. Take this case where
it would be easy to go wrong.

South was in six hearts, and West led a trump.
Declarer drew three rounds of trumps, East dis-
carding a low spade, and then cashed the A-K
of diamonds, learning that East had started with
four to the jack.

South continued with a diamond to the queen
and ruffed the fourth round of diamonds, estab-
lishing dummy’s ten as a trick. Declarer now
had to decide whether to take a finesse in spades
or clubs, but in the actual case it did not matter
which one he chose, because he would go down
one either way.

South should not have gotten himself into this
predicament. He could have assured the slam
earlier by altering his play slightly. Instead of
ruffing the fourth round of diamonds as he did,
South should have discarded a spade or a club.

East would then have found himself on lead
with the jack of diamonds and no place to go.
He would have been compelled to return a
spade or a club into one of dummy’s A-Q’s, and
this in turn would have handed declarer the
slam.

It might run against the grain for declarer to
lose a trick he can easily win, but in the present
case it is surely right to concede a diamond trick
to East in exchange for a 100 percent certainty
of making the slam.

Tomorrow: Forewarned is forearmed.
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Zits • Jim Borgman & Jerry Scott


