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Your KEY to business success.
Have your name up front when a customer needs you.

Repetitive advertising is the key to opening the door to new customers.

The Goodland Star News Service Directory
785-899-2338

Combined rates are
available to feature your services in the
Star-News and The Country Advocate.

Truck Lettering
800-886-2423

AWARD WINNING SIGNS AND PINSTRIPING SINCE 1974

Hot Brush 204 W. 4th Box 309
Bird City, Kan. 67731

Jim Alcorn, Agent
1624 S. Main Street

Goodland, KS 67735-0727
Business: (785) 899-2553

Home: (785) 899-3974

www.shelterinsurance.com

Michael Downing
General Contractor

785-626-3529 or 785-626-0060

Concrete Work • Patios & Decks
 •  Garages & Etc.  •

•  Remodels & Additions  •

“Seek Shelter Today!” American Financial Group
of Polar Investment Counsel Inc. - member SIPC, NASD, NFA, MSRB

“Investments for a Better Tomorrow”

Stock market have you SCARED?
See us for Alternative Investments!!!

www.lamerican-financial.com
Sheryl Davis

Registered Representative
1109 Main • Goodland, Kan.

• 785-890-6942

Mike van Maarth
Registered Principal

470 14th St. • Burlington, Colo.
• 719-346-9435

Commercial - Residential
Free Estimates

650 N. Grant
Colby, Kan.
785-462-6995 or 1-800-611-6735

Schedule your
 Spring cleaning

Serving NW Kansas & Eastern Colorado

Chris & Beth Lewon • “ We do windows”

Pro Floor CarePro Floor Care
Carpet and Upholstery Steam Cleaning Specialists!

Call for This Month’s Steam
Cleaning Special!

785-462-8313 • Cell: 443-1091
Toll Free: 1-800-473-4138

Commercial and Residential Carpet
Office and Dining Room Chairs

Recliners - Sofas - Autos
Drop off at our location or we can steam clean at your location

K-n-K Construction
Concrete and carpentry specialist!

We do: Landscaping, concrete decks, feedbunk pads,
bottomless stock tanks, pro pannel and anything else you
can think of. 12 years of experience.

Owner Kris Doyle

785-332-6004
home 785-332-2117
Free estimates

Have you heard
about the 900 lb.
Gorilla?
Call for details!

899-
2338

Interior/Exterior Remodeling•Drywall•Painting•Doors•Windows
Decks/Ramps•Small Building Construction/Garages

Brandon Lee
St. Francis, KS

Home: (785)332-3370
Cell: (785)332-5264

Serving the Tri-State Area!

785-462-6908
800-794-3204

Jeff Dreiling/Sales

Residential & Commercial

ROOFING
FREE ESTIMATES

740 E. 4th
Colby, KS  67701

Local DURO-LAST
Contractor

Let Advertising work
 for you!

Call Mona or Amanda

Goodland Star-News
The

785-899-2338

Auto Hail Damage Repair
Paintless Dent Removal • Windshield Repair

Free Estimates
Mobile Service • Insurance Approved

Car Perfect
Marty Church

RR 2 Box 93 • St. Francis, Kan. 67756
785-332-8930 Cell: 303-378-7018

Toll - Free: 1-877-206-2931
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Abandoned Motor Vehicle

Notice of sale of abandoned
motor vehicle in the possession
of McB’s Motor Company. The
herein described vehicle will be
sold at public auction on June 11,
2005 at 6:00 p.m., to the highest
bidder for cash, if the owner does
not claim the same prior to time
of sale and pay for removal, stor-
age and publication costs in-
curred.

Description of vehicle:
Make Chrysler, Model

Sebring, Serial or identification
n u m b e r
4C3AU52NXTE308370, Year
1995, Vehicle is in storage at 421
E.17th.

Published in The Goodland
Star-News, Goodland, Kansas,

Abandoned Motor Vehicle

Notice of sale of abandoned
motor vehicle in the possession
of McB’s Motor Company. The
herein described vehicle will be
sold at public auction on June 11,
2005 at 6:00 p.m., to the highest
bidder for cash, if the owner does
not claim the same prior to time
of sale and pay for removal, stor-
age and publication costs in-
curred.

Description of vehicle:
Make Toyota, Model Camry,

Serial or identification number
4T1BG22K414832929, Year
2001, Vehicle is in storage at 421
E.17th.

Published in The Goodland
Star-News, Goodland, Kansas,
on Fridays, May, 27 and June,
3,10, 2005.

IN THE DISTRICT COURT OF
SHERMAN COUNTY,

KANSAS

IN THE MATTER OF THE ES-
TATE OF MARY CLARE
MCCULLOUGH, DECEASED
CASE NO. 04 PR 27

NOTICE OF HEARING ON PE-
TITION FOR FINAL SETTLE-
MENT THE STATE OF KAN-
SAS TO ALL PERSONS CON-
CERNED:

On May 13, 2005, a Petition was
filed in this court by Robert C.
McCullough, executor of the will
of Mary Clare McCullough, de-
ceased, praying for a final settle-
ment of the estate, approval of
his acts, proceedings and ac-
counts as executor, allowance of
attorney fees and expenses,
determination of the heirs, devi-
sees and legatees entitled to the
estate and assignment to them
in accordance with the will of
Mary Clare McCullough, de-
ceased. You are hereby required
to file your written defenses
thereto on or before June 21,
2005, at 10:00 o’clock A. M. on
said day, in said court, in the city
of Goodland, in Sherman
County, State of Kansas, at
which time and place said cause
will be heard. Should you fail
therein, judgment and decree
will be entered in due course
upon said petition.

Robert C. McCullough, Peti-
tioner
24320 Cantrell Road
Tonganoxie, KS 66086

Michael V. Foust
#07507
126 W. 11 th Street
Goodland, KS 67735
(785) 899 5687
Attorney for Petitioner

Published in The Goodland Star-
News Fridays June 3, 10 and 17,
2005

IN THE DISTRICT COURT OF
SHERMAN COUNTY, KAN-

SAS
CIVIL DEPARTMENT

Mortgage Electronic Registra-
tion Systems, Inc, Plaintiff,

vs.

Michael Dustin Parrett a/k/a M.
Dustin Parrett, Kassy Parrett;
John Doe (Tenant/Occupant);
Mary Doe (Tenant/Occupant),
Defendants,

Case No. 05CV14
Court Number
Pursuant to K.S.A. Chapter 60

NOTICE OF SUIT

THE STATE OF KANSAS, to the
above-named defendants and
the unknown heirs, executors,
administrators, devisees, trust-
ees, creditors and assigns of any
deceased defendants; the un-
known spouses of any defen-
dants; the unknown officers,
successors, trustees, creditors
and assigns of any defendants
that are existing, dissolved or
dormart corporations; the un-
known executors, administra-
tors, devisees, trustees, credi-
tors, successors and assigns of
any defendants that are or were
partners or in partnership; the
unknown guardians, conserva-
tors and trustee of any defen-
dants that are minors or are un-
der any legal disability; and the
unknown heirs, executors, ad-
ministrators, devisees, trustees,
creditors and assigns of any per-
son alleged to be deceased, and
all other persons who are or may
be concerned.

You are notified that a Petition
has been filed in the District
Court of Sherman County, Kan-

sas, praying to foreclose a real
estate mortgage on the following
described real estate.

The North Sixty feet (N 60') of Lot
One (1), in Block Three (3) in
Kohler First Addition to the City
of Goodland, Kansas, according
to the recorded plat thereof,
commonly known as 104 Ar-
cade, Goodland, KS 67735 (the
“Property”)

and you are required to plead to
the Petition on or before the 7th
day of July, 2005, in the District
Court of Sherman County, Kan-
sas, If you fail to plead, judgment
and decree will be entered in due
course upon the Petition,

NOTICE
Pursuant to the Fair Debt, Col-
lection Practices Act 15 U.S.C.
§1692c(b), no information con-
cerning the collection of this debt
may be given without the prior
consent of the consumer given
directly to the debt collector or
the express permission of a
court of competent jurisdiction.
The debt collector is attempting
to collect a debt and any informa-
tion obtained will be used for that
purpose.

Kristen G. Stroehmann (KS Bar
No. 105511)
SOUTH & ASSOCIATES, PC.
4600 Madison, Suite 801
Kansas CIty, Missouri 64112
(815) 300-7800
ATTORNEYS FOR PLAINTIFF
(50460)

Published in The Goodland Star-
News, Goodland, Kansas, on
Fridays, May, 27 and June, 3,10,
2005.

IN THE DISTRICT COURT OF
SHERMAN COUNTY,

KANSAS

FILED PURSUANT TO CHAP-
TER 59 OFTHE KANSAS STAT-
UTES ANNOTATED IN THE
MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF
BARBARA I. LOVELACE, De-
ceased.

Case No. 05 PR 17

NOTICE OF HEARING

 THE STATE OF KANSAS TO
ALL PERSONS CONCERNED:

You are hereby notified that a
petition has been filed in this
court by Gary Lovelace, son,
pursuant to the Laws of Intestate
Succession, and one of the heirs
of Barbara I. Lovelace, de-
ceased, praying: that descent be
determined on the following de-
scribed real estate situated in
Sherman County, Kansas, to-
wit:

The North 116 feet of Lot 1 and
2, Block 23, First Addition to the
City of Goodland, Kansas.

 and all other property, real and
personal, or interest therein,
owned by the decedent at the
time of her deaths; and you are
hereby required to file your writ-
ten defenses thereto on or be-
fore the 21st  day of June, 2005,
at 10:45 o’clock a.m. on said day
in said court  in the City of
Goodland, in Sherman County,
Kansas, at which time and place
said cause will be heard. Should
you fail therein, judgment and
decree will be entered in due
course upon said petition.

Gary Lovelace, Petitioner

VIGNERY & MASON L.L.C.
214 E. 10th  P. O. Box 767
Goodland  Kansas  67735
Telephone: 785-890-6588

Published in The Goodland Star-
News on Fridays, May 27, June
3 and 10, 2005.

In the Matter of the Estate
of Lola Tompkins, Deceased

Case No. 05PR15

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

TO ALL PERSONS CON-
CERNED:

You are hereby notified that on
May 11, 2005, a Petition for Pro-
bate of Will and Issuance of Let-
ters Testamentary under the
Kansas Simplified Estates Act
was filed in this Court by
Augustus Hoyt Tompkins, an
heir, devisee and legatee, and
as executor named in the “Last
Will and Testament of Lola
Tompkins,” deceased, dated
May 25,1995.

All creditors of the decedent are
notified to exhibit their demands
against the Estate within four
months from the date of the first
publication of this notice as pro-
vided by law, and if their de-
mands are not thus exhibited,
they shall be forever barred.

Augustus Hoyt Tompkins
Petitioner

Zuspann & Zuspann
1015 Center
P.O. Box 968
Goodland, Kansas 67735-0968
Phone: (785) 899-6555
Attorneys for Petitioner

Published in The Goodland Star-
News, Goodland, Kansas, on
Fridays, May, 27 and June, 3 and
10, 2005.


