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ORDINANCE NO. 1536
AN ORDINANCE OF THE
CITY OF GOODLAND,
KANSAS, GRANTING TO
EAGLE COMMUNICA-
TIONS INC., ITS SUCCES-
SORS, LESSEES AND AS-
SIGNS, FOR A TERM OF
FIVE YEARS, THE RIGHT,
AUTHORITY, POWER
AND FRANCHISE TO ES-
TABLISH, CONSTRUCT,
ACQUIRE, MAINTAIN,
AND OPERATE A COM-
MUNITY ANTENNAE AND
CLOSED CIRCUIT ELEC-
TRONIC SYSTEM WITHIN
THE CITY OF GOOD-
LAND, KANSAS, AND EN-
VIRONS THEREOF, AND
TO USE AND OCCUPY
THE STREETS AND
OTHER PUBLIC PLACES
OF THE CITY OF GOOD-
LAND, KANSAS, FOR
SUCH COMMUNITY AN-
TENNAE AND CLOSED
CIRCUIT ELECTRONIC
SYSTEM, AND REPEAL-
ING PAST ORDINANCES
IN CONFLICT.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE
GOVERNING BODY OF THE
CITY OF GOODLAND, KAN-
SAS:

Section 1. Definitions.  For
the purpose of this ordinance,
the following terms, phrases,
words, abbreviation, and their
derivations shall have the mean-
ing given herein.  When not in-
consistent with the context,
words used in the present tense,
words in the plural number in-
clude the singular number; pro-
vided that the word “shall” is to
be construed as mandatory.

(a) City shall mean the City
of Goodland, Kansas a munici-
pal corporation, or its succes-
sors, and shall include that
which is appropriate to the use
of the term in context, the city in
its present incorporated form or
in any later reorganized, consoli-
dated, enlarged or reincorpo-
rated form.

(b) Commission shall
mean the present governing
body of the city or any future
board constituting the legislative
body of the city.

(c) Franchiseshall mean
and include the right to conduct
and operate a community anten-
nae television system within said
city subject to the terms and con-
ditions hereinafter stated in the
above-captioned ordinance.

(d) Franchisee shall mean
the person, firm, or corporation
to whom or which a franchise, as
hereinabove defined, is granted
by the commission under this or-
dinance, and the lawful succes-
sor, transferee, lessee, or as-
signee of the person, firm or
corporation.

(e) Street shall mean any
public street, roadway, highway,
alley, or other public right-of-way
now or hereafter subject to the
jurisdiction and regulation of the
city as provided by the laws of
the State of Kansas, and any
subsequent amendments
thereof.

(f) Community Antennae
Television System hereinafter
referred to, as “CATV System”
shall mean an electronic system
with properties and facilities so
constructed or presently existing
as to be used for the interception
and receipt of electro-magnetic
radiation, and transmission and
distribution of the same to sub-
scribers by means of a cable and
other related facilities.

(g) Subscriber shall mean
any person, which receives from
the franchisee herein named,
the services of the franchisee’s
CATV System.

(h) Person shall mean any
individual or association of indi-
viduals, or any firm, corporation
or other business organization.

Section 2. Grant of Non-Ex-
clusive Franchise.  After a pub-
lic hearing affording an opportu-
nity to be heard to all interested
parties, and after a review of the
qualifications of EAGLE COM-
MUNICATIONS INC., and its
reputation, whether or not it is
adequately financed, and tech-
nically competent to provide
CATV System service to the city,
and after determining that the
construction arrangements of
EAGLE COMMUNICATIONS
INC., are adequate and feasible,
there is hereby granted unto
EAGLE COMMUNICATIONS
INC., a non-exclusive franchise
to construct, erect, operate and

maintain a CATV System within
said city, and in so doing to use
the streets of said city by erec-
tion, installing, placing, burying,
construction, repairing, replac-
ing, reconstructing, maintaining
and retaining in, on, upon, or
across any such streets, such
poles, wires, cables, conduc-
tors, ducts, conduits, vaults,
manholes, amplifiers, appli-
ances, attachments, and other
property as may be necessary
and appurtenant to a CATV Sys-
tem, and in addition, so to use,
operate and provide for all or part
of such  facilities by a service of-
fering obtained from any franchi-
see or operating utility company
providing service within the city.

Section 3. Term of Fran-
chise.  The term of the franchise
herein granted shall commence
on the first day of the first month
next following the date upon
which the franchisee herein
named accepts and agrees in
writing to the terms and condi-
tions set forth in this franchise
ordinance and shall continue for
a term of five years from said
date.  Franchisee shall indicate
acceptance of this agreement,
or lack thereof, by filing accord-
ingly such written indication with
the city clerk within 30 days of
passing this ordinance.  This
franchise may be extended
upon good faith negotiations for
five subsequent terms of three
years each by providing written
notice to the city of its desire to
extend the franchise no later
than 180 days prior to the expi-
ration of the initial term for any of
the extensions thereof.

Section 4. Standards for
Construction of Franchisee’s
Facilities.  Any construction of
facilities after the effective date
of this ordinance shall comply
with the following standards:

(a) The construction of the
properties and facilities of said
franchisee’s CATV System shall
conform, at least, to the standard
of the National Electrical Code of
the National Board of Fire Un-
derwriters or the edition thereof
which has been adopted by the
city, at the time any such prop-
erties and facilities shall be con-
structed or reconstructed, pro-
vided further that said construc-
tion shall be in conformance with
all laws and regulation of the
United States of America and the
State of Kansas and the City of
Goodland, and any administra-
tive agency thereof, having juris-
diction to regulate the construc-
tion of said CATV System

(b)  All transmission and distri-
bution structures, lines and
equipment erected, or buried by
the franchisee within the city
shall be so located as to cause
minimum interference with the
proper use of streets, ease-
ments and swales, sidewalks,
alleys and other public ways and
places, and to cause minimum
interference with the rights and
reasonable convenience of
property owners who join any of
the said streets, easements,
sidewalks, alleys or other ways
and places.

(c) In case of disturbance
caused by the franchisee of any
street or paved area, the franchi-
see shall, at its expense and in
a manner approved by the city,
replace and restore such street
or paved area in as good condi-
tion as theretofore existed.

(d) The franchisee shall have
the authority to trim trees which
are located upon and overhang
the public streets and other pub-
lic ways of said city, so as to pre-
vent the branches of such trees
from coming in contact with the
franchisee’s properties, and the
trimming shall be done at all
times in a workmanlike manner.

(e) The franchisee shall not
place poles or other fixtures
where the same will interfere
with any existing gas, electric or
telephone fixtures, water hy-
drants or mains, or sewer mains,
and all such poles or other fix-
tures placed in any street shall
normally be placed at the outer
edge of the sidewalk and inside
the curb line, and those placed
in alleys shall be placed close to
the line of the lot abutting on said
alley, and then in such a manner
as not to interfere with the usual
travel on said streets, alleys and
public ways.

Prior to any underground con-
struction occurring on any street
a permit shall be applied for re-
questing permission to install
such services.  Such application
shall set forth the route, depth,
location of the proposed cable
and appurtenances.  Upon ap-
proval of the permit by the city,
the franchisee may commence

construction.
Underground construction on

private property shall not require
a permit under the terms and
conditions described above.

Section 5.  Operating Stan-
dards.  The franchisee’s CATV
system shall be constructed,
operated and maintained in ac-
cordance with the highest ac-
cepted standards of the Com-
munity Antennae Television in-
dustry and applicable city codes
and ordinances as now exist, or
may hereafter be adopted to in-
sure that the subscriber receives
the highest quality of service and
shall at all times be in conform-
ance with the FCC rules, regu-
lations and proof of performance
test provisions.  The franchisee
shall maintain an office within the
city, which office shall be open
during all usual business hours,
shall have a listed telephone,
and shall be operated so that
complaints and requests for re-
pair or adjustments may be re-
ceived at all reasonable times.

Section 6.  Additional Stan-
dards of Operations.  The fran-
chisee shall comply with the fol-
lowing additional standards of
operations.

(a) The franchisee shall at all
times make and keep full and
complete plats, maps and
records showing exact location
of its facilities located within the
streets of the city.  A copy of such
records shall be kept within the
city and available for inspection
by the city manager or his des-
ignated agent.

(b) The franchisee shall, at its
expense, protect, support, tem-
porarily disconnect, relocate in
the same street or other public
place, or remove from the street
or other public place, any prop-
erty of the franchisee when law-
fully required by the city by rea-
son of traffic conditions, public
safety, street vacation, freeway
and street construction, change
or establishment of street grade,
installation of sewers, drains,
gas or water pipes, or any other
type of structures or improve-
ments by the city; but, the fran-
chisee may in all cases have the
right of abandonment of its prop-
erty, subject to city ordinances
and approval, if federal or state
funds are available to any utility
company for the purpose of de-
fraying the cost of any of the fore-
going, such funds may be made
available to the franchisee at the
option of the city if the federal or
state regulations permit.

(c) The franchisee shall, on the
request of any person holding a
building-moving permit issued
by the city, temporarily raise or
lower or remove its wires to per-
mit the moving of building.  The
expense of such temporary re-
moval, and of raising or lowering
of wires shall be paid by the per-
son requesting the same, and
the franchisee shall have the
authority at its option to require
such payment in advance.   The
franchisee shall be given no less
than 48 hours advance notice to
arrange for such temporary wire
changes.

(d) The franchisee will limit fail-
ures to a minimum by locating
and correcting malfunctions
promptly, but in no event longer
than 24 hours after notice has
been given, except said time
shall be extended when the per-
formance of this obligation is
prevented by an act of God or the
same is otherwise made impos-
sible because of circumstances
over which the franchisee has no
control; and that the franchisee
shall provide its subscribers with
facilities for receiving request
and complaints for service.
Should a subscriber have an un-
resolved complaint regarding
cable television operation, the
subscriber shall be entitled to file
his written complaint with the city
manager, who has primary re-
sponsibility for the continuing
administration of the franchise
and procedures for resolving
complaints, and thereafter to
meet jointly with representative
of the franchisee within 30 days
to fully discuss and resolve such
matters.  The franchisee shall
notify each subscriber who shall
have filed a written complaint of
his rights to such a procedure if
the complaint is not resolved to
satisfaction of subscriber/com-
pany within 15 days.

(e) The franchisee shall at all
times employ ordinary care and
shall install and maintain in use
commonly accepted methods
and devices for preventing fail-
ures and accidents which are
likely to cause damage, injuries,
or nuisances to the public.  All
structures and all lines, equip-

ment and connections in, over,
above, under and upon all
streets of the franchise area
shall be kept and maintained in
a safe and suitable condition and
in good order and repair.

Section 7.  Indemnification
of City.  It is expressly under-
stood and agreed by and be-
tween the city and the franchisee
that the franchisee shall protect
and hold the city harmless for all
claims, action, suits, liability,
loss, expense or damage of ev-
ery kind and description, includ-
ing investigation costs, courts
costs, and reasonable
attorney’s fees, which may ac-
crue to or be suffered or claimed
by any person arising out of the
negligence of the franchisee in
the ownership, construction, re-
pair, replacement, maintenance
and operation of the CATV sys-
tem, provided the city gives
prompt notice of any such
claims, actions, and suits, with-
out limitations in writing.  The
franchisee shall maintain in full
force and effect during the life of
any franchise, public liability in-
surance in an insurance com-
pany with a national rating ac-
ceptable to the city.  The insur-
ances shall be in the sum of not
less than  $500,000.00 for per-
sonal injury to any one accident
and $500,000.00 for property
damage in any one accident.  All
such insurance may contain rea-
sonable deductible provisions
not to exceed $1,000.00 for any
type of coverage and the city
shall be named as an additional
insured.   The city may require
that any and all investigation of
claims by any person against the
city arising out of any use or mis-
use of privileges granted to the
franchisee hereunder shall be
made by, or at the expense of the
franchisee or its insurer.  The
franchisee may bring its obliga-
tions to carry any insurance now
or hereafter carried, by appropri-
ate amendment, endorsement,
or otherwise, provided, how-
ever, the interest of the city shall
be as fully protected thereby as
if the franchisee has obtained
individual policies of insurance,
and the city a named insured in
any policy.  The policy, or certifi-
cate of insurance, will be ap-
proved by the city attorney, and
filed in the office of the city clerk;
the city will receive prior written
notice of any intent to cancel in-
surance by the issuing company.

Section 8. Extensions.  The
franchisee is hereby authorized
to extend the existing  system
within the franchise area to the
extent such is or may become
economically feasible.  The fran-
chisee acknowledges the city
from time to time may add or
delete land to the city limits by
annexation or deannexation to
which franchisee is obligated to
serve under this franchise, but
said obligation to extend service
shall only be in the city limits.
The obligation shall occur when-
ever the franchisee shall receive
written requests for services
from at least 13 subscribers
within 1,000 feet of its cable plant
and the connections shall be
solely for the usual connection
and service fees for all subscrib-
ers, provided that such exten-
sion is technically feasible.  The
1,000 feet shall be measured in
extension length of franchisee’s
cable required for service lo-
cated within the public way or
easement and shall include
length of necessary service drop
to the subscriber’s home or
premise.  No person in the
franchisee’s service area shall
be arbitrarily refused service; but
in recognition of the capital costs
involved in unusual circum-
stances, including, without limi-
tations. When the distance from
distribution cable to connection
of service to subscribers is more
than 150 feet or when a sub-
scriber density exists less than
the density specified herein-
above, service shall be made
available on the basis of costs of
materials, labor, and ease-
ments, plus ten percent, in order
to prevent inequitable burdens
on potential cable subscribers in
more densely populated areas.

Section 9. Assignments.  All
provisions of this ordinance shall
be binding upon the franchisee
and all successors, lessees and
assigns of the franchisee
whether expressly stated herein
or not, however, the franchisee
may not sell or transfer this fran-
chise without the written consent
of the city, which shall not be un-
reasonably withheld.

Section 10.  Statutory Regu-
lations.  The franchise herein
granted shall be subject to all of

the provisions of Article 20 of
Chapter 12, K.S.A. and amend-
ments thereof, as may be appli-
cable to this franchise.

Section 11.  Franchise Pay-
ments.  In consideration for the
rights, privileges and franchise
hereby granted, and as compen-
sation to the city for the use of
streets and places by the fran-
chisee and in lieu of all occupa-
tion and license taxes, the fran-
chise shall, on or before the 31st
day of January and the 31st day
of July of each year in which this
franchise is effective, pay to the
city a sum equal to $0.75 per
subscriber per month for the pre-
ceding six month period ending
on the 31st day of December
and the 30th day of June, re-
spectively, for a period of five
years.

Copyright tax, local and state
sales tax and franchise tax may
be an add-on to rates and may
be automatically passed
through to the subscriber.  If
passed on these costs shall be
shown separately on billing to
subscribers.

Section 12.  Revocation of
Franchise.  The governing body
of the city may revoke the fran-
chise including, but not limited to
the following grounds:

(a) Willful and material breach
of any terms or conditions of this
franchise;

(b) Misrepresentation of fact in
the application for, or negotiation
of this franchise;

(c) Insolvency of the franchi-
see, or inability of the franchisee
to pay its just debts, or applica-
tion of the franchisee for adjudi-
cation as a bankrupt.

The city shall file with the fran-
chisee a detailed list of the
grounds alleged for revocation
of the franchise.  This notice
shall include specific details of
the acts, omissions, breaches,
or other grounds asserted as
warranting revocation.  The no-
tice shall also include the time
and date established for a pub-
lic hearing to be held on the mat-
ter before the governing body.
The franchisee shall have at
least 60 days prior to the hear-
ing and after the receipt of the
notice during which it may rem-
edy the acts, omission,
breaches, or other grounds as-
serted as giving cause for revo-
cation and which are stated in
the notice.  If prior to the time of
the public hearing, the city deter-
mines that the franchisee has
taken action during or making
significant progress toward
eliminating the causes and
grounds asserted as giving
cause to revoke, the city shall
either cancel the hearing or post-
pone the hearing for a reason-
able time to a certain date,
whichever is appropriate.  Any
evidence offered by the city, the
franchisee, subscribers or any
other interested person or entity,
whether oral or written, shall be
received by the governing body
if it tends to substantiate or dis-
prove the causes or grounds for
revocation stated in the notice.
The  governing body shall deter-
mine based on all admissible
evidence submitted to it at the
hearing, whether or not to re-
voke the franchise. Upon a find-
ing that the grounds for revoca-
tion as stated in the notice have
been substantiated by a prepon-
derance of the evidence, the
governing body shall revoke the
franchise, subject to judicial re-
views sought by the franchisee.
Revocation shall be accom-
plished by the passage of an or-
dinance and delivery of a certi-
fied copy of it to the franchisee.

Section 13.  Procedure
Upon Termination.  Upon ter-
mination of the franchise, if the
franchisee shall not have ac-
quired an extension of renewal
thereof and accepted the same,
or if it shall not have sold its prop-
erty in place, it shall promptly
remove all its property within 360
days after termination at its sole
expense.  In so removing the
property, the franchisee shall
refill, at its sole expense, any
excavation so that it shall leave
the streets in as good condition
as that prevailing prior to the
franchisee’s removal of its prop-
erty.

Section 14.  Use of Facilities.
It shall be the duty of the franchi-
see to negotiate and make any
and all contracts and agree-
ments with the owners of poles,
towers, conduits or other facili-
ties for use by the franchisee in
the provision of cable television
service under this ordinance.

Section 15. Rights of the
Franchisee. The Franchi-
see shall have the authority to

promulgate such reasonable
rules, regulations, terms and
conditions of its business as
shall be reasonably necessary
to enable the Franchisee to ex-
ercise its rights and perform its
services under this franchise
and to assure an uninterrupted
service to each and all of its cus-
tomers.    The Franchisee shall,
upon request of the City, provide
to the City a copy of such rules,
regulations, terms and condi-
tions and a copy of any changes
as may be made during the term
of the franchise.  Such rules,
regulations, terms and condi-
tions of Business shall include
rates charged for various levels
of service and the number of
channels carried for viewing
along with various levels of ser-
vice to subscribers and changes
made for installation.

Section 16. Rights Re-
served to the City.  Without limi-
tation upon the rights the city
might otherwise have, the city
does hereby expressly reserve
the following rights, power, and
authorities:

(a) The franchisee shall at all
times during the life of this fran-
chise, be subject to all lawful
exercise of the police power by
the city, and to such reasonable
regulations as the city shall here-
after by resolution or ordinance
provide;

(b) The right of reasonable
regulation of the erection, con-
struction or installation of any fa-
cilities by the franchisee and to
reasonably designate where
such facilities are to be placed
within the public ways and
places;

(c) The right to grant other
CATV franchises in the city.

Section 17.  City’s Failure to
Enforce the Terms and Condi-
tions of this Franchise.  The
city’s failure to notify, enforce, or
remedy any noncompliance by
the franchisee of any of the
terms and conditions of this fran-
chise ordinance shall not consti-
tute a waiver of the city’s rights
hereunder, and the franchisee
shall continue to perform its ob-
ligation as herein provided.

Section 18.  Amendments to
Franchise.  The city may amend
this franchise, from time to time
to enable the franchisee to take
advantage of any developments
in the field of transmission of
television and radio signals
which will afford an opportunity
to more effectively, efficiently, or
economically serve its custom-
ers and to enable the franchisee
to conform to the rules and regu-
lations of the Federal Communi-
cations Commission as they
may be amended from time to
time.

Section 19.  Emergency Use
of Franchisee’s System.  Fran-
chisee agrees to include within
their system the capability for a
remotely activated emergency
system whereby a designee of
the city in time of emergency,
may introduce a scrolling or au-
dio message on all system chan-
nels simultaneously.

Section 20.  Franchisee is
without Remedy Against the
City.  The franchisee shall have
no remedy or recourse whatso-
ever against the city for any loss,
cost, expense, or damage aris-
ing from and of the provisions or
requirements of the franchise
ordinance, because of the en-
forcement thereof by the city for
any loss, cost, expense, or dam-
age arising from any of the pro-
visions or requirements of the
franchise ordinance, or because
of the enforcement thereof by
the city, or for the failure of the
city to have the authority to grant
all, or part, of the franchise
herein granted; provided that the
franchisee expressly acknowl-
edges that it accepted the fran-
chise that it has not been in-
duced to enter into this franchise
upon any understanding of
promise, whether given verbally
or in writing by or on behalf of the
city, or by any other person con-
cerning any term or condition of
this franchise not expressed
herein; provided further that the
franchisee acknowledges by the
acceptance of this franchise that
it has carefully read the provi-
sions, terms and conditions
hereof.

Section 21. Miscellaneous
Provisions.

(a) Whenever, under the terms
of this franchise ordinance, ei-
ther party hereto shall be re-
quired or permitted to give notice
to the other, such notice shall be
in writing, and if to be served
upon the city, it shall be delivered
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